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“MIRA” is extreemly  small and compact that you can easely loading 
this machine even in a small car. 

Small but strong: Stainless steel chasis inox 
AISI 304 and the working width is 410 mm. With 
3 liters of solution tank capacity, however a 
cleaning capacity of 100 square meters thanks 
to “eco” function that controls the distribution 
of water in timed manner. 13 Ah lithium-ion 
battery of 36 volts that allow you to get one 
hour of autonomy. Essential machine for deep 
cleaning in small rooms and full of obstacles. 
Thanks to its accurate drawbar allows access 
under tables, furniture, shelves, etc.

Mira is also designed for application other than 
normal use as a scrubber drier, thanks to its 
squeegee that is liftable and also to its weight 
and thus pressure on the ground, we can use it 
to de-waxing or polishing treatments , just like 
a single brush machine.

Applying different types of brushes or pad 
holder, this machine is really polyvalent. All this 
is possible due to the oversizing of the motors 
which ensures functionality and effectiveness 
is uncommon, but above all we made the 
variable brush rotation speed.(two 210 mm 
diameter counter-rotating brush). From 140 to 
210 rpm.

TECHNICAL SPECS

Working Width Mm:

Cleaning Capacity Sq Mt/hour:

Power Unit B = Battery:

Brushes Size Mm:

Brushes Speed Rpm:

Brush Pressure:

Vac Capacity:

Clear Water Capacity:

Recovery Tank Capacity: 

Max Working Time Capacity:

410
500
B 36 VOLT / 13 ah
2/205
210
gr/cm  40
900 mmh 20
3 lt
5 lt
1 h
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